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ABSTRACT: The cowpea beetle Callosobruchus maculatus (Fab.) is a major 
insect pest of stored cowpea in Ghana. The efficacy of coconut, groundnut and 
soybean oils applied at 1, 2, 5 and 10 ml kg-! and pirimiphos-metltyl at 2.5, 5.0 
and 1.0 ",I active ingredient in 2 ml of water kg-I of grain (1116, 118 and 1/4 of 
the recommended dose) alone or in combination to adults and immature stages 
of C. maculatus and the persistence of the treatments in cowpea grain were 
evaluated in the laboratory. All the treatments caused significant mortality 
compared to untreated controls. Lower dosages of the oils and pirimiphos-metbyl 
when combined were highly toxic to C. maculatus. The mixtures also completely 
inhibited the development of immature stages of the beetle. Only pirimipbos­
methyl and the mixtures remained effective 60 days after application. Pirimipbos­
methyl can be used at reduced rates if combined with lower dosages of vegetable 
oils to control the infestation of C. maculattlS in stored cowpea. 
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INTRODUCTION 

Cowpea Vigna unguiculata is an important source of protein in the tropics 
(Owusu-Akyaw, 1991). A major constraint to hU'ge-scale cowpea production is 
the attack by a campl,;x of insect pestS fron\ the time of planting through 
harvesting and during storage. The cowpea beetle, Callosobruchus maculatus 
(Fab.) is the most serious pest of stored cowpea and if not controlled can cause 
a total loss in traditional stores in Ghana. Infestation by C. maculatus can begin 
in the field prior to harvesting when eggs are laid oJ;l maturing pods. Applica­
tion of synthetic inseeticides is the most widely used method of control1ing 




















